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This one is for 234 euro (not 100 as they mention as deposit)

—————————— Forwarded message --—--—-—--

From: hostel central station <info@hostelincentralstation.com>
Date: Thu, Feb 9, 2012 at 10:32 FM

Subject: FW: Richiesta informazioni Hotel Kennedy

To: dana bartelt@ncsu.edu

Dear DANA
Thank you for email.
Data of our banlk:

Beneficiary: wang mingxi ditta individuale

| [BAN: IT23 FO61 7501 6040 0000 5193 280

SWIFT CODE: CRGEITGG384

Flease make a bank transfer of 100euro.
Best regards.

Sofla



