Jakub Tesinsky <jatesins@ncsu.edu>

Fwd: Confirmation de votre réservation
Pocet zprav: 2

Anael Segers <asegers@ncsu.edu> 15. fijna 2012 9:35
Komu: Michael Rodrigues <michael_rodrigues@ncsu.edu>, Jakub Tesinsky <jatesins@ncsu.edu>, Dana
Bartelt <dabartel@ncsu.edu>

Michael,

Below is the email confirmation in French that 374 Euros were debited from my Pcard. See
transaction details below. Anael

Payment: ANAEL PCARD

Amount: 374 Euros

Date: 13/10/2012

Vendor: BASTILLE HOSTEL

Purpose: DEPOSIT ACCOMMODATION FASHION EXCURSION SPRING 2013

----e—e-w- Forwarded message ----------

From: BH Réception <aij-day@aijparis.com>
Date: 2012/10/13

Subject: Confirmation de votre réservation

To: "asegers@ncsu.edu" <asegers@ncsu.edu>

Paris, le 13 October
2012

North carolina State
University

Anael Segers

Email:
asegers@ncsu.edu




