
Subject: ANAEL PCARD PAYMENT: PAYMENT RCPT FILE U957149
From: Jakub Tesinsky <jatesins@ncsu.edu>
Date: 15.11.2012 21:21
To: Jakub Tesinsky <jatesins@ncsu.edu>

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: <booking@en.govolo.com>
Date: Fri, Nov 9, 2012 at 1:03 PM
Subject: PAYMENT RCPT FILE U957149
To: asegers@ncsu.edu

                  CREDIT CARD RECEIPT             November 09, 2012

  M.   SEGERS

  Following your instructions, your credit card  XXXXXXXXXXX85799 has been
  debited from a total amount in Euros of :     149.00 E     effective as
  November 09, 2012      at 13:01:28 for booking  N° U957149

  Authorization number :046062

  Passagers      Mrs.TACHEZY         ANDREA

  Departure :Mar 21, 2013    PRAGUE (REP TCHEQUE)       PARIS (FRANCE)
  Return    :Mar 24, 2013    PARIS (FRANCE)             PRAGUE (REP
TCHEQUE)

  Thank you for choosing GO VOYAGES .

--
Anaël Segers

Assistant Director
NC State University
Prague Institute
Michalská 3
110 00 Prague 1
Czech Republic

+420 224 210 106 office/kancelar
+420 725 033 177 cell/mobil
+420 224 210 111 fax
http://dev.design.ncsu.edu/prague/
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